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June 23, 2010

Bryan Sokclowski

Environmental Enforcement Specialist [
Cleveland Department of Public Health g E f
Division of Air Quality D B LE
75 Erieview Plaza 2nd Floor A
Cleveland, Ohio, 44114

RE: Corrected Alleged Violations L -
Facility ID: 13-18-00-4181 L e e

Dear Mr. Sokolowski:

On March 4, 2010, the Cleveland Division of Air Quality (CDAQ) was on-site to
complete an inspection at Cleveland Hopkins International Airport (CLE) for our
boilers, emergency generators, gas dispensing and the incinerator, resulting in a
Notice of Violation (received May 4, 2010). Although several of the operating
sources presently on-site were installed and permitted correctly over the past
decade, the new installations have been determined by CDAQ to be operating in
violation of air statues, regulations and/or air permitting conditions.

Corrective actions have been identified and corrected so that compliance can be
obtained for Ohio Administrative Code (OAC) 3745-31-02 (A)}1) and Ohio Revised
Code (ORC) Section 3704.05 (C) by completing a Permit to Operate Application for
Emission Nooz1: Kelly Incinerator (Appendix A).

Operation of four (4) of our emergency electrical generators have been identified
under Ohio Administrative Code (QAC) 3745-31-02 (A)(1) and Ohio Revised Code
(ORC) Section 3704.05 (F) and (G) for operating an emission source without first
applying for and obtaining a Permit to Install/Operate (PTIO) or by not submitting
a Permit by Rule notification form. Attached are four (4) Permit by Rule (PBR)
notification forms for the abovementioned violations (Appendix B).
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Also, as requested, attached are Permit by Rule (PBR) notification forms for the
remaining seven (7} emergency generators (Z003, Z007-Z001 and Zo14) for review
and approval (Appendix C).

An email correspondence on Wednesday June 214, from Department of Port
Control to Cleveland Department of Health stated the acceptance of fund transfers
to pay city fees. DPC Accounting Division is completing the paperwork
(dept/fund/subfund information) to transfer the retroactive amount of $4,087.50
for city permits to operate from the vears 2006-2009.

In advance, thank you for your cooperation.

Enclosures

Ce:  Fred Szabo, Commissioner
Steve Nagy, Chief of Planning and Engincering
Kim McGreal, Environmental Services Manager



Bryan Sokolowski

From: Kimmy, Linda

Sent: Monday, June 28, 2010 4:24 PM

To: Bryan Sokolowski

Subject: FW: 2006 -2009 Clean Air Permiis to Operate
'''' Original Message-----

From: Hoistbauer, Nancy

Sent: Monday, June 28, 2010 4:22 PM

To: Emery, Annette; Krzywicki, Mike

Ce’ Harry, Valarie; Osborne, Rhonda; Kimmy, Linda: Stiggers, Vakedia: McGreal, Kim
Subject: RE- 2006 -2009 Clean Air Permits to Operate

Hi Annette,
Per your information below, I processed IET - 5007- GASB20100000014- today in the amount of $4,087.50.

Nancy Hoislbauer

Budget Administrator

City of Cleveland - Department Public Health Division of Air Quality
75 Erieview Plaza 2nd floor

Cleveland, OH 44114-1839

nhoislhauer@city cleveland.oh.us

Phone 216-664-4181

Fax 216-420-8047

From: Fmery, Annette

Sent! Wednesday, June 09, 2010 12:50 PM

To: Kimmy, Linda; Stiggers, Vakedia

Ce: Harry, Valarie; Osborne, Rhonda; MeGreal, Kim
Subject: 2006 -2009 Clean Air Permits to Operate

Good Afternoon Linda,

Attached are the approved invoices for 2006, 2007, 2008, & 2009, a total amount of $4087.50.

If I understand correctly, the billing department is required to do the Internal Expense Transfer (IET)
CAS coding is: FUND 60 SUBFUND 001 DEPT 3001 UNIT 00 APPR UNIT 640 OBJECT 6455

Please call me with any questions at 216 898-5174.

Annette L. Emery

Cleveland Airport Svstems
Department of Port control
Airport Finance

Accountant IV 1

Phr 216 898-5174 *--o—-()-0%
FX: 216 265-6069
ABEmerv@clevelandairport.com



